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         KERALA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION

Ranked list  for the post of  LOWER DIVISION TYPIST (Part-II Rrcruitment
By  Transfer)  -  on  Rs.  26500  -  60700/-  in  Various  Departments  in
MALAPPURAM District
Ranked List No.    593/2024/DOM                                                                Cat.No. 726/2022

                                              NOTIFICATION  

The following is the list  of candidates for selection to the post of  LOWER DIVISION
TYPIST  -  Part  II  (Recruitment  By  Transfer)   on  RS  26500-  60700 in  Various
Departments in Malappuram District, found suitable by the Commission and arranged in
the order  of  merit  on the  basis  of  objective  Type (OMR) test  held on 12.08.2023.  This
Ranked List is brought into force with effect from   15/05/2024
Candidates who have secured forty percent  (40%) marks and above in the OMR test are
included in the list and the unadvised candidates remaining in the Part II of the previous
Ranked List in carried over and included at the top of this list.  

 

(Rank  No.  1  to  9   carried  over  from  the  previous  Ranked  List
Dated.10.11.2020)

Cat.No.281/2018

Rank Reg No Name DOB Remarks

1 128635 SUMEERA P S 10/05/1980

2 129634 ZEENATH M K 20/04/1971

3 130573 UMESH KUMAR P 04/03/1982

4 128668 GEETHA PALLIKKUTH 24/12/1977

5 130789 DILEEP K 11/09/1985

6 130009 GIRISH C 31/05/1977

7 129328 SUMI P V 24/05/1981

8 130170 SIVANANDAN P G 30/05/1981

9 128377 SUMATHY V 25/12/1973
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CAT.NO.726/2022

10 1032433 ABDUL MUTHALIB U P 08/05/1986

11 1032903 SANAL PALUNNAN 24/06/1992

12 1032122 SHEEJA CHIRAYIL 10/02/1983

13 1034030 LIMNA A 25/05/1983

14 1031646 SINDHU P 28/05/1980

15 1032015 SAJITHA P S 30/05/1983

16 1031940 SMITHA P 16/03/1980

17 1029872 SIVADAS P 20/05/1987

18 1031108 ANOOPA K 07/02/1986

19 1032816 NISHAD M K 26/03/1992

20 1032204 DEEPA PC 05/02/1980

21 1031057 AJINA KP 01/06/1985

22 1032869 MURALIKRISHNAN KK 23/10/1990

23 1037299 REMYA K R 12/05/1985

24 1032893 JOY P 01/05/1975

25 1031238 SALINI K 19/09/1980

NOTE (1) :- Since a common OMR Test with common candidates was conducted for 
this post, the marks awarded to candidates included in this Ranked List and mark of 
OMR test relating to all candidates appeared for the test will be published only after the 
publication of entire Ranked Lists (including NCA Notifications) which will be finalised
on the basis of the common test.

NOTE (2) :- The result of rechecking of OMR answer scripts will be intimated in due
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course.  But  photocopy  of  the  OMR  answer  scripts  will  be  issued  only  after  the
publication of the Ranked Lists for all the posts finalised on the basis of the common
test.

NOTE (3)  :-  Candidates  from the  Ranked  List  will  be  advised  for  appointment  in
against  the  10% vacancies  reported  to  the  Commission  during the  pendancy  of  the
Ranked List. As the advice for appointment depends on the occurence of vacancies there
is  no  guarantee  that  all  the  candidates  included  in  the  Ranked  List  will  secure
appointment.  In  case  the  candidates  included  the  Ranked  List  couldn’t  secure
appointment before the expiry of the Ranked List, the names of such candidates will be
included at the top of the new Ranked List of the Low paid employees drawn up by the
Commission subsequently in the same order and they will be advised for appointment
accordingly (Vide G.O (P) No.39/89/P&ARD dated 08/12/1989)

NOTE (4):- According to the existing procedure, revaluation of Answer script is not
allowed. But Answer scripts will be rechecked if the candidates apply for through their
One  Time  Registration  profile  from  the  Commission's  official  website  www.kerala
psc.gov.in by remitting the prescribed fee of Rs. 85/- (Rupees Eighty Five only). The
fee can be remitted by e-payment through the portal. Applications submitted in any other
manner (ie Email/Tappal/Direct) will not be considered. A period of  15 (Fifteen)  days
time to apply for rechecking of Answer scripts will be allowed to candidates with effect
from the date on which the Ranked List is uploaded in the website of the Commission
(on or before 10/06/2024).

NOTE (5):- Candidates who wish to obtain a photocopy of their OMR Answer sheets
(Part A & Part B) relating to this selection shall submit online application through their
One  Time  Registration  profile  from  the  official  website  of  the  Commission,
www.keralapsc.gov.in  by  remitting  the  prescribed  fee  of  Rs.  335/- (Rupees  Three
Hundred and Thirty Five) via e-payment mode available in the portal. A period of 15
(Fifteen) days time to apply for photocopy of OMR sheets will be allowed to candidates
with effect from the date on which the Ranked List is uploaded in the website ofthe
Commission (on or before 10/06/2024). Application submitted in any other manner (ie
Email/Tappal/Direct) will not be considered. A copy of the answer sheet will be issued
only once to a candidate. Copies of OMR sheets invalidated due to any defect will not
be issued.

NOTE (6) :-  The candidates who wish to relinquish their claim for advice from the
Ranked List shall submit an application in the format prescribed by the Commission to
the District Officer, Kerala Public Service Commission District Office, Civil Station
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(PO),  Malappuram- 676505. The  format  is  available  in  the  official  website  of  the
Commission. The request for relinquishment in respect of those who do not submit the
relinquishment  application  in  the  format  prescribed  by  the  Commission  will  not  be
honoured under any circumstances.  The request  for  relinquishment  in the prescribed
format should be duly attested by a Gazetted Officer of State/ Central Government with
signature, name, designation and office seal along with a notarized affidavit and a self
attested copy of an ID proof bearing photograph as enlisted in the General Conditions.
The request for relinquishment, along with the original of notarized affidavit and self
attested copyof an ID proof received within 15 days from the date of publication of
Ranked List  in the official  website of the Commission will  be honoured against  the
requisitions of vacancies that are pending with the Commission upto the finalization of
the Ranked List. After the publication of the Ranked List the request for relinquishment
will be considered only if such request is received on or before the date of receipt of
requisition based on which he/she is to be advised. 

NOTE (7):- The A part and B part of OMR scripts will be destroyed after completing
six months period from the date of finalisation of last Ranked List in the common test.

                                                                         ( By Order of the Commission ) 

                                                                                      BIJUMON M A
                                                                               DISTRICT OFFICER 
                                                               KERALA PUBLIC SERVICE COMMISSION 
                                                                     DISTRICT OFFICE, MALAPPURAM

Office of the Kerala Public Service Commission 
District Office,Malappuram

Approved for issue,

Section Officer.
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