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The following is the Short List containing the Register Numbers of candidates who are found provisionally eligible to
be called for Interview, subject to the verification of the Original documents, for selection to the post of Divisional
Accountant-By Transfer from among U.D Clerks of all Departments  (including Assistants of the Administrative
Secretariat and the Finance Secretariat and the office of the Kerala Public Service Commission and Auditors of the
Kerala State Audit Dept.) and those above U.D Clerks/Assistants,Senior Accountants/Auditors in the Non
Gazetted cadre- STATEWIDE (Category No. 393/2021) in Kerala General Service on 50,200-105,300/- on the basis
of the DESCRIPTIVE Examinations held on 03-06-2023 & 04-06-2023.

The Register Numbers are arranged in their numerical sequence and the arrangement does not in any way, indicate
their respective rank on the basis of the said test. The candidates whose numbers are included in Short List are
directed to be present for verification of original documents as per schedule published in due course.
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Note :- (1) Inclusion of Register Numbers in this list is purely provisional subject to scrutiny and admission of
application on absolute basis. Inclusion of Register numbers in the Short List does not confer any right on the
candidate for inclusion in the Ranked List.

Note :- (2) The list has been prepared by including the number of candidates who have secured top marks in the
Descriptive Test. Only those candidates who have secured 40% marks each for Papers I&II and 50% marks for Paper
III (for SC/ST candidates, 30% each for Paper I & II and 35% for Paper III) have been considered.

Note :- (3) 14 (Fourteen) candidates who have secured 219.2 ( two hundred nineteen (point) two ) marks and
above, subject to the condition mentioned in Note-2 are included in the Short List .

Note :- (4) Candidates included in the Short List should present and produce in person the original documents for One
Time Verification. Date,time and Venue of OTR Verification will be published shortly.

Note :- (5) According to the existing procedure, revaluation and rechecking of answer scripts is not allowed. Detailed
instructions will be published in the Ranked List to be published for the post.

Note :- (6) The register number of candidate who do not produce the required documents within the prescribed time
limit and whose application found otherwise defective will be deleted from the Short List without further notice.

Note :- (7) Scanned image and Tabulation sheet of Answer Scripts of the Descriptive Tests held on 03.06.2023 and
04.06.2023 will be issued only to those candidates who had attended all the three papers who, apply for the same
remitting the prescribed fee after the publication of the Ranked List.  Candidates whose Register Numbers are
invalidated are advised to refer to Notification No : ER XIV (3)3324/2023/EW Dtd. 27/05/2024

Total number of Candidates in the ShortList : 14

Number of Candidates in the Main List : 14


