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The following is the Short List containing the Register Numbers of candidates who are found provisionally eligible to
be called for Practical Test, subject to the verification of the Original documents, for selection to the post of Heritage
Document Translator - STATEWIDE (Category No. 129/2023 ) in Collegiate Education Department on Rs. 27,900
– 63,700/- on the basis of the DESCRIPTIVE Test held on 07/08/2024.

The Register Numbers are arranged in their numerical sequence and the arrangement does not in any way, indicate
their respective rank on the basis of the said test. The candidates whose numbers are included in Short List are
directed to be present for verification of original documents as per schedule published in notification.

HEAD OFFICE, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM

Phone : 0471-2546400
eMail : kpsc.psc@kerala.gov.in

SL.No.

NOTIFICATION

Main List
500726 500732 500739 500741 500759 500766

500768 500774 500780 500783 500784 500798

500801 500803 500807 500819 500836 500864

500870 500899 500900 500912 500934 500939

500941 500958 500959 500963 500969 500972

500989 500997 501001 501005 501017 501021

501046 501075

Supplementary List
Nil
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Note :- (1) Inclusion of Register Numbers in this list is purely provisional subject to scrutiny and admission of
application on absolute basis. Inclusion of Register numbers in the Short List does not confer any right on the
candidate for inclusion in the Ranked List.

Note :- (2) The Short List has been prepared based on the details furnished by the candidate in the application and
subsequent claims made will not be entertained at any stage of selection.

Note :- (3) All 38  (Thirty Eight ) Candidates who have found eligible and qualified  in the Descriptive examination
are included in the Main List of this Short List. The marks secured by the last candidate in the Main List is 2.25 (Two
(point) two five) marks.

Note :- (4) Candidates included in the Short List should be present in person and produce the original documents for
One Time Verification and Interview. Date,Time and Venue of OTR Verification will be published shortly

Note :- (5) The Register Number of those candidates who do not produce the required documents within the
prescribed time limit and whose application found otherwise defective will be deleted from the Short List without
further notice.

Note :- (6 )Candidates belong to Other Backward Classes included in the Short List , eligible for reservation are
requird to produce Non Creamy Layer Certificate as per G.O (P) No.81/09/SCSTDD dated 26.09.2009 or that
obtained through e-district project in the format prescribed in G.O (Rt) No.3942/2018/RD dated 24.09.2018 and SC/ST
candidates are required to produce Community Certificate (Form III/ Digitally signed) issued by the Revenue Authority
not below the rank of Tahsildar and candidates who claim EWS reservation are required to produce EWS Certificate
vide G.O.(MS)No.2/2020/P&ARD dated 12.02.2020 issued by the Revenue Authority along with other documents at
the time of OTR verification of original documents.

Note :- (7) According to the existing procedure, revaluation and rechecking of answer scripts is not allowed. Detailed
instructions will be published in the Ranked List to be published for the post.

Note :- (8) Scanned image and Tabulation Sheet of Answer Scripts of the Descriptive Test held on 08/09/2023 will be
issued to those candidates who, apply for the same remitting the prescribed fee after approval of the Ranked List. No
Candidates is invalidated for the above mentioned post vide Notification No. ER8-1/11/2024-KPSC dated 07/07/2025

Total number of Candidates in the ShortList : 38

Number of Candidates in the Main List : 38


